
 
 

A Fall Tradition Returns; Register for the NAHMA October Meeting 
 
Alexandria, Va., Sept. 14, 2022 ― With summer winding down, it is time to set our sights on fall … the 
National Affordable Housing Management Association (NAHMA) Biannual Top Issues in Affordable 
Housing fall conference, that is. Online registration is open. NAHMA members and affordable housing 
industry partners will meet in person in the District of Columbia from Wednesday, Oct. 26-Friday, Oct. 
28. Register for the conference and book your room today. 
 
With a focus on the top issues facing affordable housing, the meeting, Oct. 26-28, takes place at the 
Fairmont Washington, 2401 M St. NW, Washington, DC. The NAHMA room block single/double rate is 
$369. The discounted rooms are booked on a first-come, first-served basis and expire on or before Oct. 
3, depending on availability. Reserve your room online today, 
https://book.passkey.com/event/49909285/owner/56417/home. Room reservations are not included in 
the meeting registration; they must be booked separately.  
 
Additionally, the NAHMA Educational Foundation will be honoring the nonprofit organization’s 
Inspiration Award winner at its annual gala, taking place in conjunction with NAHMA’s meeting. The 
gala, Thursday, Oct. 27, at The Hay-Adams, will also feature a live and silent auction. The gala requires a 
separate ticket and is not included as part of the NAHMA October meeting registration. For information 
on available gala sponsorship opportunities, visit https://www.nahma.org/wp-
content/uploads/2022/06/2022-Sponsorship-Form.pdf. 
 
The meeting, taking place Wednesday through Friday, will feature educational panels geared explicitly 
toward the affordable housing industry led by experts in their fields. Invited guests include 
representatives from the departments of Housing and Urban Development and Agriculture and more. 
Meeting registration includes admission to the Vanguard Awards luncheon, panel discussions, and 
committee meetings. A preliminary agenda is available on the Meetings webpage.  
 
Gold sponsors, Alliant Insurance Services, Conner Strong & Buckelew, McGriff Insurance Service Inc., 
RealPage and Yardi, and silver sponsor, Auto-Out Cooktop, make the NAHMA meeting possible. 
 
For more information regarding the meeting, contact Brenda Moser, director of meetings and 
membership, by calling 703-683-8630, ext. 114, or emailing brenda.moser@nahma.org. 
 
NAHMA is the leading voice for affordable housing management, advocating on behalf of multifamily 
property managers and owners whose mission is to provide quality affordable housing. NAHMA 
supports legislative and regulatory policy that promotes the development and preservation of decent 
and safe affordable housing, is a vital resource for technical education and information and fosters 
strategic relations between government and industry. NAHMA’s membership represents 75% of the 
affordable housing industry, and includes its most distinguished multifamily owners and management 
companies. Visit www.nahma.org for more information. 
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Jennifer Jones, Director of Communications and Public Relations 
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